
What is Rogation? - These are the three days before Ascension Day and are not to be 
confused with the Fifth Sunday after Easter, “Commonly called Rogation Sunday”.  
Rogation Sunday is so-called only because it is the Sunday preceding the Rogation Days.  
It is the three days which are of significance and not the preceding Sunday.

Perhaps the significance of the Rogation Days can best be understood from two things -- 
the origin of the word “rogation” and the time of year in which the day occurs.  “Rogation” 
comes from the Latin verb, rogare which means simply to ask or beg.  We see this root 
repeated in other English words such as “interrogation”.  The Rogation Days are therefore, 
first of all, days of prayer and supplication, days of asking God for something.

What do we ask of God on these days?  Here the calendar comes in.  The days are in 
spring, when the crops are being sown, when everything is bursting out in new leaf, new 
growth, new life.  Therefore the Rogation Days are days in which Godʼs blessing is asked 
for the new crops and for a fruitful season in growth.  In fact, the Rogation Days and 
Harvest Thanksgiving should be bracketed together -- the former to ask for good crops, 
the latter to give thanks for good crops.

These Rogation Days and their observance are of ancient if somewhat confusing origin, 
perhaps in one form or another going back to the fourth of fifth centuries.  In part they may 
have originated as a Christian substitute for pagan rites in honor of Robigo, the god 
believed to be the protector of crops from mildew.  In any event, the form followed from 
earliest days was that of a Litany, a long collection and series of prayers of intercession 
and praise.  In England, the use of litanies on these days is still widespread, combined 
with the custom of “beating the bounds” of the parish in procession.

Another excellent explanation may be found on a Blog spot
http://anglicancontinuum.blogspot.com/2006/05/rogation-sunday.html

Orders of service
Worcester Diocese - two imaginative orders of service with intercessions etc 
http://www.cofe-worcester.org.uk/pdf_lib/27.pdf

A fine order of service from a Lutheran source in the mid - West of the USA. The common 
source of Anglican and Lutheran liturgy is evident.
http://www.synodresourcecenter.org/wma/worship/occasional/other/0017/
rogation_sunday.html

Collective worship 
School assembly,from Culham College. Source also for children's address
http://cowo.culham.ac.uk/assemblies/022p_rogation.php

Intercessions
http://worldwidebiblestudies.org/Study583455-Give-Us-This-Day-Our-Daily-Bread-
Intercessions-For-Rogation-Sunday.htm

Prayers of the people
http://www.thisischurch.com/prayer_worship/intercession/intercessionseaster62004.

Online sermon sources
What should we ask for?
http://www.st-michaels.org.uk/Sermons%202006/Sermon%20Rogation%202006.pdf
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Thy will be done - Sermon by Canon Stephen Cherry of Durham Cathedral.
http://www.durhamcathedral.co.uk/schedule/sermons/151
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